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HIGHER EDUCATION 
RES EAR C H 

Managing Private Institutions 
of Higher Learning 
An interview with the Deputy Director General of 
the Department of Higher Education Management 
(Private Higher Education) 

Munir Shuib & Shukran Abdul Rahman 

Private Hi g her Educati on in 
Malaysia i s a n importa nt 
component for nation bui ldi ng and 
has contributed enormously lO !.he 
development of the country and its 
human capital. It ac ts as an 
important economic contributor to 
t he country and provi des 
employment opportunities for its 
citizens. 

Today, Malaysia is witnessing the 
emergence of many new private 
institutions of higher learni ng 
compr ising colleges, univers ity 
colleges and universities. The 
country boas ts 559 pri va te 
institut ions of higher learning 
including 11 univers iti es, II 
university colleges, five foreign 
branch campuses and 532 coUeges. 

Pr ivate inst itu tions of higher 
learning serve a key national asset 
to the country so much so that the 
gove rnme nt has g iven great 
attention to their development and 
performance . The Mini stry of 
Higher Education, entrusted 10 look 
into [his matter, has set up a special 
section called Pri vate Institutions 
of Higher Learning Management 
Sector, which is placed under the 
Department of Higher Educat ion. 
its primary role is to develop the 
private higher education industry. 

The Private Institutions of Higher 
Learning Management Section is 
headed by the Deputy Director 
General of Department of Higher 
Education Management (Private 
Hi gher Education Institutions) 
whose c urrent incumbent is 
Professor Dr. Mahani Zainal 
Abidin , a professor at Department 
of Economics, Uni vers ity of 
Malaya. Specialising in Economic 
Development and Trade, Mahani 
was appointed a member of the 
National Economic Action Council 
(NEAC) during the country' s 
economi c downturn in 1998 and 
had later served as H ead of 
Globalisation Consultancy Team in 
the counci l. Her successes in 
spearheading the country to ass ist 
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